
Contact Screening on a College Campus 
Staff/student  identified as 

tuberculosis 

suspect 

Non  communicable TB suspect  
(AFB  smear negative,  CXR  

noncavitary,  patient  with  few  or 
no  symptoms 

No contact screening needed on 
campus 

  

    

  
   

 

   
    

  
 

  
   

   
   

 

Communicable TB suspect  (AFB  
smear positive,  CXR  cavitary,  

patient  symptomatic) 

Public  Health  notifies Student  
Health 

The suspect is excluded from 
school pending clearance from 

Public Health 

TB suspect will be cleared to 
return to school after 3 

sequential negative Sputum 
Smears for AFB 

Student  Health  works with  PHN  
to  provide information  on  
suspect’s classes,  dates of 

attendance,  brief description  of 
nature of classes,  lists/addresses  

of classroom  participants 

Student  Health  works with  PHN  
to  determine who  is at  risk of TB 

exposure and  to  schedule 
convenient  date and  location  of 

testing 

Public  Health  prepares letters for 
contacts determined to  be at  risk 

of exposure to  TB and  mails to  
contacts with  dates/location  of 

scheduled  PPD  testing 

Identified  contacts are given  PPD  
skin  tests and  education  with  

appropriate follow up  depending  
on  results 

Testing  is repeated if necessary,  

3  months following  last  potential  
exposure 

Results of contact investigation 
will be summarized by Public 

Health, appropriate follow up will 
be determined and results shared 

with Student Health 




